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To explain the mystery of how life evolved on Earth, Nick Lane explores the deep link between energy
and genes.

The Earth teems with life: in its oceans, forests, skies and cities. Yet there’s a black hole at the heart of
biology. We do not know why complex life is the way it is, or, for that matter, how life first began. In The
Vital Question, award-winning author and biochemist Nick Lane radically reframes evolutionary history,
putting forward a solution to conundrums that have puzzled generations of scientists.

For two and a half billion years, from the very origins of life, single-celled organisms such as bacteria
evolved without changing their basic form. Then, on just one occasion in four billion years, they made the
jump to complexity. All complex life, from mushrooms to man, shares puzzling features, such as sex, which
are unknown in bacteria. How and why did this radical transformation happen?

The answer, Lane argues, lies in energy: all life on Earth lives off a voltage with the strength of a lightning
bolt. Building on the pillars of evolutionary theory, Lane’s hypothesis draws on cutting-edge research into
the link between energy and cell biology, in order to deliver a compelling account of evolution from the very
origins of life to the emergence of multicellular organisms, while offering deep insights into our own lives
and deaths.

Both rigorous and enchanting, The Vital Question provides a solution to life’s vital question: why are we as
we are, and indeed, why are we here at all?
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From reader reviews:

Alicia Hendrickson:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who
don't like looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this The Vital Question: Energy, Evolution, and the Origins of
Complex Life.

Patricia Thomas:

The guide untitled The Vital Question: Energy, Evolution, and the Origins of Complex Life is the e-book
that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a
lot of study when write the book, and so the information that they share to you personally is absolutely
accurate. You also could get the e-book of The Vital Question: Energy, Evolution, and the Origins of
Complex Life from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Beth Stewart:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet.
Every year has been exactly added. This guide The Vital Question: Energy, Evolution, and the Origins of
Complex Life was filled concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific
research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how
big good thing about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like today, many
ways to get book you wanted.

Alita Schmidt:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra The Vital
Question: Energy, Evolution, and the Origins of Complex Life.
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