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Embedded systems are usually composed of several interacting components such as custom or application
specific processors, ASICs, memory blocks, and the associated communication infrastructure. The
development of tools to support the design of such systems requires a further step from high-level synthesis
towards a higher abstraction level. The lack of design tools accepting a system-level specification of a
complete system, which may include both hardware and software components, is one of the major
bottlenecks in the design of embedded systems. Thus, more and more research efforts have been spent on
issues related to system-level synthesis.
This book addresses the two most active research areas of design automation today: high-level synthesis and
system-level synthesis. In particular, a transformational approach to synthesis from VHDL specifications is
described.
System Synthesis with VHDL provides a coherent view of system synthesis which includes the high-level and
the system-level synthesis tasks. VHDL is used as a specification language and several issues concerning the
use of VHDL for high-level and system-level synthesis are discussed. These include aspects from the
compilation of VHDL into an internal design representation to the synthesis of systems specified as
interacting VHDL processes.
The book emphasizes the use of a transformational approach to system synthesis. A Petri net based design
representation is rigorously defined and used throughout the book as a basic vehicle for illustration of
transformations and other design concepts. Iterative improvement heuristics, such as tabu search, simulated
annealing and genetic algorithms, are discussed and illustrated as strategies which are used to guide the
optimization process in a transformation-based design environment. Advanced topics, including
hardware/software partitioning, test synthesis and low power synthesis are discussed from the perspective of
a transformational approach to system synthesis.
System Synthesis with VHDL can be used for advanced undergraduate or graduate courses in the area of
design automation and, more specifically, of high-level and system-level synthesis. At the same time the
book is intended for CAD developers and researchers as well as industrial designers of digital systems who
are interested in new algorithms and techniques supporting modern design tools and methodologies.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Gay:

This System Synthesis with VHDL book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will
get information which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That System
Synthesis with VHDL without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in thinking and
analyzing. Don't always be worry System Synthesis with VHDL can bring whenever you are and not make
your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone.
This System Synthesis with VHDL having very good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will
not sense uninterested in reading.

Mildred Smith:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name System
Synthesis with VHDL suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular
book untitled System Synthesis with VHDLis the one of several books this everyone read now. This kind of
book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new
dimensions that you ever know previous to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all
of people can easily to understand the core of this reserve. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Janette Collins:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent the entire day to reading a publication. The book System Synthesis with VHDL it is rather good to
read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You
can m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book
offers high quality.

Harold Scott:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many
books in the top list in your reading list is System Synthesis with VHDL. This book and that is qualified as
The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upward and review



this book you can get many advantages.
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